
U N I V E R S I T Y OF N E W E N G L A N D ( A M E N D M E N T ) 
A C T , 1980 , N o . 102 

ANNO VICESIMO NONO 

ELIZABETHE II REGINE 

Act N o . 102 , 1980 . 

An Act to amend the University of New England Act, 1953, with 
respect to official members of the Council of the University; 
and for certain other purposes. [Assented to, 1st May, 1980.] 



BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by 
the authority of the same, as follows :— 

1. This Act may be cited as the "University of New England 
(Amendment) Act, 1980". 

2. (1) Except as provided in subsection ( 2 ) , this Act shall 
commence on the date of assent to this Act. 

(2) Section 4, in its application to Schedule 1, and 
Schedule 1 shall commence on the day on which Schedule 1 (2) 
(a) to the University of New England (Amendment) Act, 1978, 
commences. 

3. This Act contains the following Schedules :— 

SCHEDULE 1 . — A M E N D M E N T TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W 
ENGLAND A C T , 1953. 

SCHEDULE 2 . — A M E N D M E N T S TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W 
ENGLAND A C T , 1953, BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW 
REVISION. 

4. The University of New England Act, 1953, is amended in 
the manner set forth in Schedules 1 and 2. 



SCHEDULE 1. 

A M E N D M E N T TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W ENGLAND 
A C T , 1 9 5 3 . 

Section 1 0 ( 3 A ) — 

After section 1 0 ( 3 ) , insert :— 

( 3 A ) Where a person (not being a person who is a 
member of the Council) is appointed at any time to act in 
the place of— 

(a) the Chairman of the Academic Board of the 
University; or 

(b) the Principal of the Armidale College of 
Advanced Education, 

that person shall, while so acting, be deemed to be an 
official member of the Council. 

SCHEDULE 2 . 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W ENGLAND A C T , 
1 9 5 3 , BY WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION. 

( 1 ) Section 1 — 

Omit the section, insert instead :— 

1 . This Act may be cited as the "University of New 
England Act, 1 9 5 3 " . 

( 2 ) (a ) Section 3 ( 1 ) , definition of "New England University 
College"— 

Omit " - 1 9 5 2 " . 



SCHEDULE 2-—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W ENGLAND A C T , 1 9 5 3 , 
BY WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION—continued. 

(b) Section 3 ( 2 ) ( b ) — 

Omit "paragraph (c) of subsection ( 4 ) of section 1 0 " , 
insert instead "section 1 0 ( 4 ) ( c ) " . 

(c) Section 3 ( 2 ) (d) — 

Omit "paragraph (a) of subsection ( 4 ) of section 1 0 " , 
insert instead "section 1 0 ( 4 ) ( a ) " . 

( 3 ) Section 8 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "Act :", insert instead "Act.". 

( 4 ) (a) Section 1 0 ( 4 ) , proviso— 

Omit "of this subsection" wherever occurring. 

(b) Section 1 0 ( 4 ) , proviso— 

From paragraph (iii), omit "three persons", insert 
instead " 3 persons". 

(c) Section 1 0 ( 5 ) — 

Omit "seven persons", insert instead " 7 persons". 

(d) Section 1 0 ( 6 ) ( c ) — 

Omit "three years", insert instead " 3 years". 

(e) Section 1 0 ( 7 ) (a) ( i i ) — 

Omit "paragraph (b) of subsection ( 4 ) " , insert 
instead "subsection ( 4 ) (b ) " . 



SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W ENGLAND A C T , 1 9 5 3 , 
BY WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION—continued. 

( 5 ) Section 1 2 ( c ) — 

Omit "four consecutive meetings", insert instead " 4 
consecutive meetings". 

( 6 ) Section 1 4 ( 4 ) — 

Omit "three consecutive meetings", insert instead " 3 
consecutive meetings". 

( 7 ) Section 1 5 ( 1 ) ( e ) — 

Omit "three years", insert instead " 3 years". 

( 8 ) Section 1 7 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "one year", insert instead " 1 year". 

( 9 ) Section 1 8 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "five years", insert instead " 5 years". 

( 1 0 ) Section 2 2 ( 2 ) — 

Omit "paragraph (d) of subsection ( 1 ) " , insert instead 
"subsection ( 1 ) ( d ) " . 

( 1 1 ) (a ) Section 2 4 (1)-

Omit "this section", insert instead "subsection ( 2 ) " . 

(b) Section 2 4 ( 2 ) — 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead " 2 1 years". 



S C H E D U L E 2—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE UNIVERSITY OF N E W ENGLAND A C T , 1953, 
BY WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION—continued. 

(12) Section 2 6 ( 1 ) ( a ) , (2) ( a ) — 

Omit "the first day of January" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "1st January". 

(13) Section 33 (1) — 

Omit "By-laws:", insert instead "By-laws.". 

(14) Section 34— 

Omit "the thirty-first day of December", insert instead "31st 
December". 

(15) (a) Section 36 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "the thirty-first day of December", insert instead 
"31st December". 

(b) Section 36 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "twelve months", insert instead "12 months". 


