
1982 Local Government Amendment (Miscellaneous No. 56 
Fees and Penalties) 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT AMENDMENT (MISCELLANEOUS 
FEES AND PENALTIES) ACT 1982 

No. 56 of 1982 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short title. 
2. Principal Act. 

3. Amendment of section 129 of 
Principal Act (Minutes). 

4. Amendment of section 189 of 
Principal Act (Procedure for 
making by-laws). 

5 . Amendment of section 214 of 
Principal Act (Dog tax). 

6. Amendment of section 328 of 
Principal Act (Estimates to be 
open to inspection). 

7. Amendment of section 329 of 
Principal Act (Statements 
and accounts to be prepared 
annually) . 

8. Amendment of section 773 of 
Principal Act (Certificate as to 
ra tes and charges). 

AN ACT to amend the Local Government Act 1962 for the purposes 
of increasing certain fees and penalties payable under that Act and 
increasing the maximum amount of the dog tax that may be levied 
under that Act in respect of certain dogs. 

[Royal Assent 30 November 1982] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

845 

1-This Act may be cited as the Local Government Amendment Short title. 

(Miscellaneous Fees and Penalties) Act 1982. 



846 

Principal Act. 

Amendment of 
section 129 of 
Principal Act 
(Minutes). 

Amendment of 
section 189 of 
Principal Act 
(Procedure for 
making 
by-laws). 

Amendment of 
section 214 of 
Principal Act 
(Dog tax). 

Amendment of 
section 328 of 
Principal Act 
(Estimates to 
he open to 
inspection) . 

Amendment of 
section 329 of 
Princi pal Act 
( Statements 
and accounts 
to be prepared 
annually). 

Amendment of 
section 773 of 
Principal Act 
(Certificate as 
to rates anel 
charges). 

No. 56 Local Government Amendment (Miscellaneous 
Fees and Penalties) 

1982 

2-In this Act, the Local Government Act 1962;': is referred to 
as the Principal Act. 

3-Section 129 (4) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" 25 cents" and substituting " $2 ". 

4-Section 189 (4) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" 20 cents for every 100 words" and substituting " 50 cents for 
every page ". 

5-( 1) Section 214 (2) (ac) of the Principal Act is amended 
by omitting" $4 " and substituting" $8 ". 

( 2) Section 214 (6) (b) of the Principal Act IS amended by 
omitting" 25 cents" and substituting" $1 ". 

( 3) Section 214 (9) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" liable to a penalty of $10 " and substituting" guilty of an offence 
and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not exceeding $50 ". 

(4) Section 214 ( 12) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" 25 cents" and substituting" $1 " 

6-Section 328 (1) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" 50 cents" and substituting" $2 ". 

7-Section 329 (3) of the Principal Act is amended as follows:­
(a) by omitting " 50 cents" and substituting " $2 "; 

(b) by omitting" $1 . 25 " and substituting" $5 ". 

8-Section 773 (1) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" 50 cents" and substituting" $5 ". 

"No. 67 of 1962. For this Act, as amended up to and including 1st July 1980, see the continuing 
Reprint of Statutes. Subsequently amended by Nos. 19, 44, and 59 of 1980, Nos. 48, 77, and 89 
of 1981, and No. 9 of 1982. 




