
196 2. 319 

VICTORIA. 

ANNO UNDECIMO 

ELIZABETH.^ SECUND^ REGIN^ 

No. 6914. 

An Act relating to Agricultural Education. 

[20th November, 1962.] 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is 
to say):— 

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Agricultural Education Short title. 

(Continuation) Act 1962. 

(2) The Agricultural Education Act 1958 is in this Act referred Principal Act 

to as the Principal Act. ^S:^^^^ 
No. 6492. 

2. (1) The Principal Act shall be amended as follows :— Amendments of 
No. 6195. 

(a) In sub-section (1) of section three— s. 3. 
Appropriation 

(i) for the words " One thousand nine hundred un"°"sitV° 
and fifty-nine" there shall be substituted f̂ r*̂ ''i'£„'j™ai 
the words "One thousand nine hundred cin^im^i 
and sixty-two " ; and "*"""• 

(ii) for the words " Thirty-five thousand pounds " 
there shall be substituted the words " Fifty 
thousand pounds " ; 

(6)-In 



320 1962. Agricultural Education {Continuation). No. 6914 

S. 4. 
Appropriation 
of moneys 
for 
investigations 
and educational 
work in 
relation to 
irrigation. 

S. 5. 
Provision for 
employment of 
graduates in 
agricultural 
science in 
certain 
Government 
departments. 

Continuation 
of Principal 
Act and 
retrospective 
operation of 
amendments. 

(b) In section four for the words " One thousand nine 
hundred and fifty-nine" there shall be substituted 
the words " One thousand nine hundred and 
sixty-two " ; 

(c) In sub-section (1) of section five for the words " thirteen 
years " there shall be substituted the words " sixteen 
years ". 

(2) The Principal Act shall be deemed to have been so amended 
on the thirtieth day of June One thousand nine hundred and 
sixty-two and shall be deemed to have continued and shall continue 
in operation accordingly. 

Saving. (3) All persons things and circumstances appointed or created 
by or under the Principal Act or existing or continuing under that 
Act at the said thirtieth day of June shall have the same status 
operation and effect as they respectively would have had if the 
Principal Act had not expired on that date but had been amended 
as provided by this Act on that date. 


