
408 1 9 7 1 

VICTORIA. 

ANNO VICESIMO 

ELIZABETHS SECUNDS REGINS 

Short title. 

No.8171. 

An Act to amend Part III. of the Coal Mines Act 1958. 

[Wh November, 1971.] 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is 
to say):— 

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Coal Mines {Pensions 
Increase) Act \91\. 

Principal Act 
No. 6221. 
Reprinted to 
No. 7628. 
Subsequently 
amended by 
Nos. 7715 7718, 
7805,7857 7878, 
8005, 8123. 

Amendment of ' 
No. 6221. 
increases in 
rates of 
pension. 

S. 104. 
Retiring 
pension. 

S. 105. 
Incapacity 
pension. 

(2) In this Act 
Principal Act. 

the Coal Mines Act 1958 is called the 

2. (1) The Principal Act shall be amended as follows 

(a) In section 104 for the expression " $18.25 " there shall 
be substituted the expression " $19.50" ; 

(Z>) In sub-section (1) of section 105 for the expression 
" $ 1 8 . 2 5 " there shall be substituted the expression 
" $ 1 9 . 5 0 " ; 

(c) In 



1971. Coal Mines (Pensions Increase). No. 8171 409 

(c) In paragraphs (a) and (c) of section 106 for the -̂ '"*• 
expression "$13.75" there shall be substituted the pat̂menû'm 
expression "$14.50"; and ^X êSw. 

(d) In sub-sections (1) and (1A) of section 107 for the s. 107. 
expression " $17.25" there shall be substituted the ĴJISeNo 
e x p r e s s i o n " $ 1 8 . 5 0 " . dependents. 

(2) The rates of pensions payable under Part III. of the 
Principal Act as amended^ by the provisions of sub-section (1) 
shall have and be deemed to have had effect on and from the 8th 
day of October, 1971. 


