
A N N O T R I C E S I M O Q U A R T O 

ELIZABETHAE SECUNDAE REGINAE 

VICTORIA 

Coal Mines (Pensions Increase) Act 1985 

No. 10182 
An Act to amend Part III. of the Coal Mines Act 1958 

and for other purposes. 

[Assented to 12 June 1985] 
BE IT ENACTED by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is to 
say): 

Short title. 

1. This Act may be cited as the Coal Mines (Pensions Increase) Act 
1985. 

Commencement. 

2. This Act shall come into operation on the day on which it receives 
the Royal Assent. 

Principal Act. 

3. In this Act the Coal Mines Act 1958 is called the Principal Act. NO. 6221. 
Reprinted to No. 
8953. 
Subsequently 
amended by Nos. 
9427.9576, 
9699,9902,9921 
and 9945. 

43 



1985 Coal Mines (Pensions Increase) No. 10182 

Amendment of Principal Act. 

4. The Principal Act is amended as follows: 
(a) In section 104 for the expression "$41.25" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$102.30"; 
(b) In section 105 for the expression "$41.25" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$ 102.30"; 
(c) In section 106 (a) for the expression "$18.75" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$67"; 
(d) In section 106 (b) for the expression "$4.50" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$ 14"; 
(e) In section 106 (c) for the expression "$18.75" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$67"; 
(J) In section 107 (1) for the expression "$40.25" there shall be 

substituted the expression "$102.30"; 
(g) In section 107 (1A) for the expression "$40.25" there shall 

be substituted the expression "$102.30"; and 
(h) In section 110(3)— 

(i) for the expression "Coal Mines (Pensions Increase) Act 
1973" there shall be substituted the expression "Coal 
Mines (Pensions Increase) Act 1985" and 

(b) for the expression "Social Services Act 1947" there shall 
be substituted the expression "Social Security Act 
1947". 

Increased rates applicable from 1 June 1985. 

5. The rates of the pensions payable under Part III. of the Principal 
Act as amended by section 4 have effect on and after 1 June 1985. 

44 


