26 Gro. V.] Umversity (Veterinary Research). [No. 4308

No. 4308.
An Act to amend Section Three of the University
Act Amendment Act 1930.

[14th October, 1935 ]

E it enacted by the King’s Most Excellent Majesty by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and the Legislative Assembly of Viectoria in this
present Parliament assembled and by the authority of the
same as follows (that is to say) —

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Umiversity
(Veterinary Research)y Act 1935 and shall be read and
construed as one with the Umiversity Act 1928 and any
Act amending the same all of which Acts and this Act may
be cited together as the University Acts.

(2) This Act shall be deemed to have come into operation on
the first day of July One thousand nine hundred and thirty-five.

2. Section three of the University Act Amendment Act
1930 is hereby amended as follows :—
(@) In sub-section (1)—

(i) .for the words “One thousand nine
hundred and thirty ” there shall be
substituted the words “ One thousand
nine hundred and thirty-five”; and

(ii) for the words * Three thousand five
hundred pounds” there shall be
substituted the words *‘ Three thousand

| three hundred pounds”; and
() In paragraph (a) of sub-section (2) for the words
“Two thousand seven hundred pounds” there
shall be substituted the words “ Two thousand

five hundred pounds”.

93

Short title
construction
and citation.

Nos, 3795, 3042,
3001 s. 41, 4100
8. 17,4116, 4166,
4212 3. 6, 4304

s. O

Commencement.

Amendments of
No. 3942 8. 3.

Grant for five
years for
rescarch d&c.
In connexion
with a
veterinary
research
institute.

Application of .
payments,




